

Bidsheet towards Fifth e-Auction

SR NO	DEPT STACK NO.	AUCTION NO	TYPE	DATE	TIMESLOT	Available Qty (MT)	Offered Quantity (MT)	Type	Grade	Base Price	BID QTY	BID PRICE	SUCCESSFUL BIDDER	Location	T.C.No.	Leasholder/Intrested Party	Remarks
1	PO L1(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	9:00 AM to 10:00 AM	73364	73000	Lumps	54.97	500	73000	540	Royalline Resources Ltd	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	Note: Quantity Offered 73,000(Lumps) of Stack No PO L1(CODLI)-126/53 is allotted to Royalline Resources Ltd. for the highest bid, who had requested for the Full Quantity via Application No. RRL/DOM/029 Dated 06/11/2014 as approved by government
2	PO F14(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	9:00 AM to 10:00 AM	101773	101000	Fines	55.56	540	101000	540	JSW STEEL LIMITED	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	
3	PO F11(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	180322	180000	Fines	57.06	590	30000	630	Sesa Sterlite Limited	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	
4	PO F11(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	180322	180000	Fines	57.06	590	30000	610	Royalline Resources Ltd	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	
5	PO F11(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	180322	180000	Fines	57.06	590	120000	590	JSW STEEL LIMITED	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	
6	PO F10(CODLI)-126/53	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	207962	207000	Fines	55.93	500	30000	500	Sesa Sterlite Limited	Codli Mine	126/53	Sesa Goa Ltd/Government of Goa	Residual (Unsold) Quantity:177000
7	L1(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	5000	5000	Lumps	59.5	880	5000	900	Royalline Resources Ltd	COSTI MINES	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
8	F5 A(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	6755	6000	Fines	60	930	2000	1170	JSW STEEL LIMITED	COSTI MINES	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
9	F5 A(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	6755	6000	Fines	60	930	4000	1150	Royalline Resources Ltd	COSTI MINES	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
10	F5 B(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	1:30 PM to 2:30 PM	7144	7000	Fines	53	500				COSTI MINES	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	No Bids Recorded
11	F4(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	1:30 PM to 2:30 PM	10950	10000	Fines	53	500				COSTI MINES	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
12	F-1(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	54475	54000	Fines	62	1140	54000	1900	JSW STEEL LIMITED	COSTI Plants	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
13	F3(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	4594	4000	Fines	53	500				COSTI Plants	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid.:F3(COSTI)-VDC,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:4000
14	F2(COSTI)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	10019	10000	Fines	61.5	1090	10000	1550	JSW STEEL LIMITED	COSTI Plants	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
15	F1(BIMB)-CHWG	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	22843	22000	Fines	61.6	900	22000	1340	Sesa Sterlite Limited	Bimbol Mines,Collem/Sigao	ore purchased from 07/41 & 23/53	Chowgule & Company Pvt Ltd/Government of Goa	
16	R3(SIRIGAO)-CHWG	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	6-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	322766	322000	ROM	51.50	500				SIRIGAO PLANT	5/49-13/49	Chowgule & Company Pvt Ltd/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:R3(SIRIGAO)-CHWG,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:322000
17	F1(CAUR)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	9:00 AM to 10:00 AM	33650	33000	Fines	57.00	500	33000	500	Royalline Resources Ltd	CAUREM PLANT	14/52 & 19/54	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	
18	F3(CAUR)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	9:00 AM to 10:00 AM	36500	36000	Fines	47.00	500				CAUREM PLANT	14/52 & 19/54	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:F3(CAUR)-TIMBLO,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:36000
19	7(CHUN)-75/52	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	10439	10000	Fines	50.74	500.00				CHUNIMOLO MINES, RIVONA	75/52	SHRI VOIKUNTA KADNEKAR (LATE)/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:7(CHUN)-75/52,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:10000
20	1(CHUN)-75/52	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	14780	14000	Fines	59.05	530.00	14000	830	Royalline Resources Ltd	CHUNIMOLO MINES, RIVONA	75/52	SHRI VOIKUNTA KADNEKAR (LATE)/Government of Goa	
21	ROM 1(CURP)-03/51	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	10:30 AM to 11:30 AM	67609	67000	ROM	56.12	500				Curpem Mine	03/51	Sesa Resources Limited/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:ROM 1(CURP)-03/51,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:67000
22	F8(SHEL)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	6070	6000	Fines	62.5	1390	6000	1710	JSW STEEL LIMITED	SHELVONA Jetty	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
23	F6(SHEL)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	9695	9000	Fines	62.5	1390	2000	1730	JANKI CORP LIMITED	SHELVONA Jetty	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
24	F6(SHEL)-VDC	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	12:00 PM to 1:00 PM	9695	9000	Fines	62.5	1390	7000	1710	JSW STEEL LIMITED	SHELVONA Jetty	40/50 & 16/51	V.D. Chowgule Late/Government of Goa	
25	FINE STACK NO 8(SULC)-10/51	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	1:30 PM to 2:30 PM	14107	14000	Fines	51.10	500				Survey No 14/1-SULCORN	10/51 PURCHASED FROM	MINESCAPR-KADAR ORES PVT LTD/Government of Goa	eAuction No. which was scheduled from 13:30 HRS TO 14:30HRS has been cancelled.
26	FINE STACK NO 1(SULC)-10/51	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	1:30 PM to 2:30 PM	28802	28000	Fines	52.85	500				Survey No 14/1-SULCORN	10/51 PURCHASED FROM	MINESCAPR-KADAR ORES PVT LTD/Government of Goa	
27	FINE STACK NO 2(RIV)-10/51	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	1:30 PM to 2:30 PM	61520	61000	Fines	54.40	500				Survey No 168/1-Rivona	10/51 PURCHASED FROM	MINESCAPR-KADAR ORES PVT LTD/Government of Goa	
28	F4B(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	27401	27000	Fines	54.00	500				TOLLEM PLANT	33/57, 19/54, 42/56, 5/53, 8/50, 14/52 & 68/53	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:F4B(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:27000
29	F4A(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	28308	28000	Fines	55.00	500.00				TOLLEM PLANT	33/57, 19/54, 42/56, 5/53, 8/50, 14/52 & 68/53	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:F4A(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:28000
30	F2A(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	55000	55000	Fines	58.50	630.00	10000	890	Bagadiya Brothers Private Limited	TOLLEM PLANT	33/57, 19/54, 42/56, 5/53, 8/50, 14/52 & 68/53	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	
31	F2A(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	55000	55000	Fines	58.50	630.00	45000	870	JSW STEEL LIMITED	TOLLEM PLANT	33/57, 19/54, 42/56, 5/53, 8/50, 14/52 & 68/53	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	
32	F1B(TOLLEM)-TIMBLO	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	3:00 PM to 4:00 PM	90202	90000	Fines	62.60	1060.00	90000	2280	KIOCL LIMITED	TOLLEM PLANT	33/57, 19/54, 42/56, 5/53, 8/50, 14/52 & 68/53	TIMBLO ENTERPRISES/Government of Goa	
33	H1(VGS)-VMS	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	139644	139000	Fines	50.26	500				VAGUS JETTY	83/52,19/58,29/54, 50/53 & 16/55	V.M. Salgaoncar & Bro. Pvt. Ltd./Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:H1(VGS)-VMS,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:139000
34	M2(VGS)-VMS	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	46510	46000	Lumps	47.75	500	46000	500	Sesa Sterlite Limited	VAGUS PLANT	83/52,19/58,16/55 & 50/53	V.M. Salgaoncar & Bro. Pvt. Ltd./Government of Goa	
35	P7(VGS)-VMS	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	61938	61000	Fines	50.03	500				VAGUS PLANT	83/52,19/58,29/54 & 50/53	V.M. Salgaoncar & Bro. Pvt. Ltd./Government of Goa	Unsold / Part Unsold Lot Nos/No Bid:P7(VGS)-VMS,Residual (Unsold) Quantity:61000
36	N2A(VGS)-VMS	Fifth E-Auction	Price cum Qty Bidding	7-Nov-2014	4:30 PM to 5:30 PM	142935	142000	ROM	49.50	500	142000	500	V M Salgaocar and Brother Private Limited	VAGUS PLANT	83/52,19/58 & 50/53	V.M. Salgaoncar & Bro. Pvt. Ltd./Government of Goa	