

Sr.No	T.C.No	Lot No.	Stack No	Location	Cargo Owner	Declaration	Grade submittedBy party	Grade as per DMG Anaylisis	Type	Available Quantity	Base Price	Bidder Name	Sold Qty	Bid price	Sale Value at Bid Price	Sheet No.	Auction Date	Auction Timing	Balance
1	35/55	MR STACK 3	MR STACK 3-35/55	Pale Mine	Government of Goa	Soc.Timblo Irmaos Ltda (PtI)	49	49.1	ROM	32,859.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				32,859.00
2	35/55	MR STACK 4	MR STACK 4-35/55	Pale Mine	Government of Goa	Soc.Timblo Irmaos Ltda (PtI)	48	40.69	ROM	1,36,848.00	350.00	mstc/SEABIRD MARINE SERVICES/127437	3,000.00	350.00	10,50,000.00	1596	27/05/2020	11:00:00-13:00:00	1,33,848.00
3	35/52	ROM 1	RIV-ROM 1	Rivona Mine	Government of Goa	Sesa Resources Limited	55.45	56.24	ROM	10,313.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				10,313.00
4	35/52	ROM 2	ROM 2-35/52	Rivona Mine	Government of Goa	Sesa Resources Limited	55.3	27.6	ROM	29,583.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				29,583.00
5	35/52	ROM 3	ROM 3-35/52	Rivona Mine	Government of Goa	Sesa Resources Limited	54.87	53.9	ROM	51,914.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				51,914.00
6	35/52	ROM 4	ROM 4-35/52	Rivona Mine	Government of Goa	Sesa Resources Limited	53.2	54.37	ROM	9,373.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				9,373.00
7	30/50	R1	R1-30/50	Collem Mine	Government of Goa	Dr. Prafulla R Hede	48-50	38.55	ROM	23,044.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				23,044.00
8	76/52	ROM_1	ROM 1-76/52	Advaplae Mine	Government of Goa	Sesa Goa Ltd	54.11	49.52	ROM	1,097.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,097.00
9	31/55	R-3	R-3-31/55	Gavanem Mines	Government of Goa	Chowgule & Co Pvt. Ltd	51.5	39.42	ROM	3,548.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				3,548.00
10	7/41 23/53	R2	R2-EMCO	Bimbol Mines	Government of Goa	Emco Goa Pvt Ltd	45	50	ROM	62,567.00	350.00	mstc/Sesa Sterlite Limited Iron Ore Goa/58874	62,560.00	350.00	2,18,96,000.00	2240	27/05/2020	18:24:00-19:24:00	7.00
11	24/57	R1	Dharb-R1	Suevey No.138/1 Dharbandora	Government of Goa	Velingkar Brothers	34.43	34	ROM	44,264.00	350.00	mstc/Sesa Sterlite Limited Iron Ore Goa/58874	44,260.00	350.00	1,54,91,000.00	2240	27/05/2020	18:24:00-19:24:00	4.00
12	04/49	10	10-4/49	Sirigao Mine	Government of Goa	Rajaram Bandekar (Sirigao) Mines Pvt Ltd	45	44.52	ROM	10,500.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				10,500.00
13	16/55	21	R21-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	36.85	37	ROM	5,600.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				5,600.00
14	16/55	27	R27-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	38.94	39	ROM	22,488.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				22,488.00
15	83/52,19/58 & 50/53	N2D	N2D-VMSB	Vagus Plant	Government of Goa	V.M.Salgocar & Bros Pvt Ltd	46.68	45.43	ROM	567.00	350.00	mstc/V M Salgaocar and Brother Private Limited/59027	560.00	350.00	1,96,000.00	1596	27/05/2020	11:00:00-13:00:00	7.00
16	43/53	R1	R1-43/53	Oiteiro Divodgal_Curdi	Government of Goa	Noor M Abdul Karim/ Timblo Mineral Pvt Ltd	48-50	45.60	ROM	19,284.00	350.00	mstc/SHIRODKAR AND COMPANY/79056	19,280.00	350.00	67,48,000.00	1597	27/05/2020	12:00:00-12:53:14	4.00
17	3/57 33/57 19/54 42/56	R15	R15-KUNDA	Patiem / Tudou Mine	Government of Goa	Kunda R Gharse	45-48	48.35	ROM	1,70,785.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,70,785.00
18	3/57 33/57 19/54 42/56	R16	R16-KUNDA	Patiem / Tudou Mine	Government of Goa	Kunda R Gharse	45-47	43.79	ROM	24,165.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				24,165.00
19	3/57 33/57 19/54 42/56	R17A	R17A-KUNDA	Patiem / Tudou Mine	Government of Goa	Kunda R Gharse	42-46	40.63	ROM	25,745.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				25,745.00
20	3/57 33/57 19/54 42/56	R18A	R18-KUNDA	Patiem / Tudou Mine	Government of Goa	Kunda R Gharse	40-45	42.96	ROM	49,600.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				49,600.00
21	92/52	R1	R1-92/52	Dignem Mine	Government of Goa	Timblo Pvt Ltd	45-52	47.23	ROM	1,882.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,882.00
22	45/54	STACK R1R	STACK R1R-45/54	Vagus Jetty	Government of Goa	Sova	48.5	48.63	ROM	15,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				15,000.00
23	45/54	STACK R3R	STACK R3R-45/54	Vagus Jetty	Government of Goa	Sova	48.5	46.11	ROM	42,629.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				42,629.00
24	44/51	RSTACK 1	RSTACK 1-44/51	Joleracho Dongor	Government of Goa	Shantilal Khusaldas & Bros Pvt Ltd	48-50	50	ROM	25,440.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				25,440.00
25	28/52	LG/ROM/1	LG/ROM/1A-28/52	Chunimolo Mines	Government of Goa	Pratham Resources Pvt Ltd/Shantilal	46	46	ROM	1,109.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,109.00
26	28/52	LG/ROM/1	LG/ROM/1B-28/52	Chunimolo Mines	Government of Goa	Pratham Resources Pvt Ltd/Shantilal	49.5	50	ROM	1,917.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,917.00
27	75/52	6	R 6-75/52	Chunimolo Mines, Rivona	Government of Goa	Kadnekar Valcunth	51.04	52	ROM	16,382.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				16,382.00
28	12/53	7	R 7-12/53	Bategal Mines, Maina	Government of Goa	Kadnekar Valcunth	45.24	46	ROM	1,092.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,092.00
29	84/52	VI-D	VI-D-84/52	Kotambi Jetty/Plot	Government of Goa	Bandekar Brothers Pvt Ltd	43.37	48.17	ROM	1,50,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,50,000.00
30	84/52	VAG-ROM1	VGS/R-1-84/52	Vagus Stack	Government of Goa	Bandekar Brothers Pvt Ltd	43.74	41.99	ROM	1,96,366.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,96,366.00
31	84/52	2	2-84/52	Pale Mine	Government of Goa	Bandekar Brothers Pvt Ltd	46.54	28.53	ROM	1,75,425.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,75,425.00
32	14/52	R-1	R-1-14/52	Colomba / Sulcora Mine	Government of Goa	Badrudin Hussainbhai Mavani	48-55%	49	ROM	68,089.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				68,089.00
33	08/50	R-1	R-1-08/50	Patiem / Uquem Mine	Government of Goa	R R Painguinkar	35-40%	48.16	ROM	32,698.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				32,698.00
34	02/57	R 8 & R 9	R 8 & R 9-02/57	Muguli / Costi Mine	Government of Goa	Mahablshwar Garco	48-59	48.59	ROM	13,800.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				13,800.00
35	87/53	ROM STACK 1	ROM STACK 1-87/53	Shigao Mine	Government of Goa	Soc.Timblo Irmaos Ltda (PtI)	46.13	53.07	LUMPS	24,510.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				24,510.00
36	87/53	MR STACK (A&B)	MR STACK (A&B)-87/53	Shigao Mine	Government of Goa	Soc.Timblo Irmaos Ltda (PtI)	42.39	43.48	FINES	47,956.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				47,956.00
37	30/50	T1	T1	Maina Jetty	Government of Goa	Dr. Prafulla R Hede	48-50	48-50	FINES	1,652.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,652.00
38	39/53	F1	Arvaletm -F1	Arvaletm Mine	Government of Goa	Lekhraj Nathurmal (Late)	<50	33.67	FINES	607.29	350.00	mstc/Nathurmal Eco Minerals Private Limited/128693	600.00	350.00	2,10,000.00	1598	27/05/2020	13:00:00-13:30:00	7.29
39	126/53	F1A	F1-B-126/53	Sanvordem Jetty	Government of Goa	Sesa Goa Ltd	51.38	57.07	FINES	615.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				615.00
40	126/53	F1B	F1-C-126/53	Sanvordem Jetty	Government of Goa	Sesa Goa Ltd	61.84	53.99	FINES	625.00	600	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				625.00
41	126/53	DTP-1	DTP-A-126/53	Dharbandora Plot	Government of Goa	Sesa Goa Ltd	59.24	54.00	FINES	113.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				113.00
42	126/53	DTP-2	DTP-B-126/53	Dharbandora Plot	Government of Goa	Sesa Goa Ltd	61.84	59.22	FINES	174.00	600.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				174.00
43	ore purchased from 07/41 & 23/53	F3	F3-EMCO	Mpd Jetty	Government of Goa	Chowgule & Co Pvt. Ltd	44	44	FINES	45,630.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				45,630.00
44	23/53	F2	EMCO-F2	Bimbol Mines	Government of Goa	Emco Goa Pvt Ltd	44	44.51	FINES	68,584.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				68,584.00
45	16/55	10	10-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	41.92	46.30	LUMPS	800.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				800.00
46	16/55	11	11-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	48.63	47.42	FINES	250.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				250.00
47	16/55	17	17-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	44.71	44.17	FINES	650.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				650.00
48	16/55	20	SONUS-20	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	38.19	39.80	LUMPS	2,100.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				2,100.00
49	16/55	22	22-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	43.23	39.98	FINES	740.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				740.00
50	16/55	23	23-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	43.23	39.61	FINES	150.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				150.00
51	16/55	24	24-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	43.23	45.84	FINES	1,700.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,700.00
52	16/55	27A	R-27-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	38.94	42.39	FINES	46,272.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				46,272.00
53	16/55	27B	27A-16/55	Sonus Onvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	38.94	38.94	LUMPS	21,740.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				21,740.00
54	16/55	7	7-16/55	Cudnem Plot	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	50.85	52.53	LUMPS	190.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				190.00
55	16/55	8	8-16/55	Cudnem Plot	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	49.00	50.02	LUMPS	280.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				280.00
56	16/55	9	9-16/55	Cudnem Plot	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	46.57	51.60	LUMPS	160.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				160.00
57	83/52,19/58,29/54 & 50/53	P8D	P8D-VMSB	Vagus Plant	Government of Goa	V.M.Salgocar & Bros Pvt Ltd	48.87	50.36	FINES	7,638.00	350.00	mstc/V M Salgaocar and Brother Private Limited/59027	7,630.00	350.00	26,70,500.00	1599	27/05/2020	14:00:00-14:30:00	8.00
58	92/52 PURCHASED FROM	F1	F1-92/52	Maina Jetty	Government of Goa	Timblo Enterprises	46.5	46.5	FINES										

Sr.No	T.C.No	Lot No.	Stack No	Location	Cargo Owner	Declaration	Grade submittedBy party	Grade as per DMG Anaylisis	Type	Available Quantity	Base Price	Bidder Name	Sold Qty	Bid price	Sale Value at Bid Price	Sheet No.	Auction Date	Auction Timing	Balance	
93	84/52	1-PALE	1-84/52	Pale Mine	Government of Goa	Bandekar Brothers Pvt Ltd	47.65	30.12	ROM	1,00,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,00,000.00	
94	84/52	1-SHELP	SHEL-1-84/52	Shelpem Plot	Government of Goa	Bandekar Brothers Pvt Ltd	46.16	46	ROM	1,00,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,00,000.00	
95	68/53	RI	RI-68/53	Uquem Mine	Government of Goa	Vicente Fernandes	48-50%	57.74	ROM	1,000.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,000.00	
96	16/55	13	13-16/55	Sonus Orvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	48.25	49.47	LUMPS	200.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				200.00	
97	16/55	15	15-16/55	Sonus Orvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	47.70	18.60	FINES	1,100.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,100.00	
98	16/55	25	25-16/55	Sonus Orvalim	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	34.10	36.36	FINES	1,100.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				1,100.00	
99	75/52	1	1(CHUN)-75/52	Chunimolo Mines, Rivona	Government of Goa	Kadnekar Valcunth	59.05	59.05	FINES	780.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				780.00	
100	02/57	8	11-02/57	Muguli / Costi Mine	Government of Goa	Mahablwshwar Garco	Below 55%	45.11	FINES	6,000.00	500.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				6,000.00	
101	17/49	1	1-17/49	Near Balaji Pits	Government of Goa	A.X.Poi Palondicar	48.00	50.86	Lumps	5,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				5,000.00	
102	17/49	2	2-17/49	Near Balaji Pits	Government of Goa	A.X.Poi Palondicar	48.00	46.86	FINES	5,000.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				5,000.00	
103	Purchased from 63/51	1	1-63/51	Cudnem Plot	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	46.83	48.72	Fines	3,466.95	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				3,466.95	
104	16/55	1	1-16/55	Cudnem Plot	Government of Goa	V.G. Quenim (Late)	46.83	48.72	FINES	17,813.00	350.00	NO BID	0.00	0.00	0.00				17,813.00	
											24,95,387.24									23,21,407.24

Note:-The DMG shall not entertain any complaint with regards exact grade of ore as e-auction is on as and where basis and opportunity is given to the bidders to draw Samples before the e-auction

BALANCE	23,21,407.24	2,321,407.24
SOLD	1,73,980.00	0,17,398
PUT TO ACTION	24,95,387.24	2,495,387.24